CITY OF VICTORIA, TEXAS
BID TABULATION FOR
ANNUAL SUPPLY CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR THE FIRE DEPARTMENT
February 3, 2010

Fisher Scientific Interboro Pkg. Corp. School Nurse Supply Kentron Health Care, Inc.
Pittsburgh, PA Montgomery, NY Schaumberg, IL Springfield, TN
ITEM| QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 10 |Hudson RCI#1171 Airway 5.5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 10 |Hudson RCI #1170 Airway $6 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 10 |Hudson RCI#1169 Airway #7 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 40 |Hudson #1168 Airway $8 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 70 [Hudson RCI#1167 Airway #10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
7 30 |Hudson RCI#1166 Airway #11 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8 10 |Hudson RCI#1165 Airway #12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
9 12 |Robertazzi #1-5076-26 Nazo Airway 26FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 12 |Robertazzi #1-5076-30 Nazo Airway 30Fr $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
11 | 450 |[Hospilak #302 -E Oxygen Cannula Adult $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12 150 |B&F #64092 Pedi Oxygen Mask $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 | 3700 [Hudson RCI#1060 Nonrebreather Mask Adult $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
14 250 [Airlife Misty Max 10 #002438 Nebulizer $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
15 6 |Rusch #150025 Endo Tube 2.5mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 6 |Rusch #150030 Endo Tube 3.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
17 6 |Rusch #150040 Endo Tube 4.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 8 |Rusch #170050 Endo Tube 5.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
19 80 |[Rusch #170060 Endo Tube 6.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 60 |Rusch #170070 Endo Tube 7.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
21 30 [Rusch #170080 Endo Tube 8.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
22 10 |Rusch Laryn. Blade for #0 Miller #4020 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
23 10 |[Rusch Laryn. Blade for #1 Miller #4021 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
24 20 |Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Miller #4022 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
25 10 |[Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Mac #4042 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 25 |Rusch Laryn. Blade for #3 Miller #4023 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
27 20 |Rusch Larn. Blade #3 for Mac #4043 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
28 30 |Rusch Laryn. Blade #4 for Mac #4044 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
29 10 |King KLTSD413 Yellow Size 3 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
30 25 |[King KLTSD414 Red Size 4 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
31 15 |King KLTSD415 Purple Size 5 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
32 | 160 |Ambu Spur Il Adult Disp. Resuscitator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $3,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Fisher Scientific Interboro Pkg. Corp. School Nurse Supply Kentron Health Care, Inc.
Pittsburgh, PA Montgomery, NY Schaumberg, IL Springfield, TN
ITEM| QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
33 15 |Ambu Spur Il Pediatric Disp. Resuscitator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $21.50 $322.50 $0.00 $0.00
34 4 |Ambu Spur Il Infant Disp. Resusciator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
35 100 |3M #1870 Flat Fold Disp. Respirator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.00 $2,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
36 75 |Endo Tube Holder Ambu#320264040 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
37 30 |Endo Tube Introducer 15FR/CH $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
38 10 |Kendall Safe-T-Vac #30820 Suction Catheter Sz 8 FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
39 | 20 |Kendall Safe-T-Vac #31820 Suction Catheter Sz 18FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
40 5 [Kendall Safe-T-Vac Suction Catheter Size 5FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
41 | 10 [#142 Disposable Suction Bulb Sysring $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
42 | 150 |Medline DYND50246 Connecting Tubing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
43 | 150 |HI-D Big Stick Pharyn. Suction Tip $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
44 | 90 |Bemiss System Il Disp. Suction Canister Red Top $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
45 | 75 |#42500-02 Introcan Cathlon 24gx3/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $111.00
46 | 450 |#4252519-02 Introcan Cathlon 22gx1" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $666.00
47 | 2800 |#4252535-02 Introcan Cathlon 20gx1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $4,144.00
48 | 860 |#4252560-02 Introcan Cathlong 18g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $1,272.80
49 | 120 [#4252586-02 Introcan Cathlon 16g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $177.60
50 | 100 |#4251890-02 Introcan Cathlon 14g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.48 $148.00
51 | 300 |#NN1838R Hyp. Needles 18g x 1 1/2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
52 | 100 |#NN2325R Hyp. Needle 23g x 1 1/2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
53 | 100 |#NN2516R Hyp. Needle 25g x 5/8" $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
54 | 15 |Vidacare EZ-IO Needle Set 15 ga - 15mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55 | 35 |Vidacare EZ-IO Needle Set 15ga - 25mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
56 5 |Vidacare #9077 EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
57 | 25 |Terumo SS-30L Syring w/o Needle 30cc $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
58 | 300 |Terumo SS10L Syring w/o Needle 10cc/ml $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
59 | 100 |Terumo SS-03L Syring w/o Needle 3cc/ml $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
60 | 3000 |Selec-3 #B10-102 IV Admin Set $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
61 | 3080 |Pro-Line #12125 IV Fild Start Kit $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
62 25 |Alcohol Prep Pads $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.50 $62.50 $0.00 $0.00
63 | 10 |Hydrogen Peroxide $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.89 $8.90 $0.00 $0.00
64 | 10 |Personal Protection $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
65 | 30 |[5x9 Surgical Dressing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
66 | 45 |4"x4" Dressing Sponge $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
67 | 30 |3"x9" Adaptic Dressing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
68 | 310 [Saline-WetDressing 8"x4" 12 Ply $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
69 6 |41"x38" Drape Sheet $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
70 4 |2"x4" X-Lg. Bandaids $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.60 $14.40 $0.00 $0.00
71 | 25 |1'x3" Reg. Bandaids $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.46 $61.50 $0.00 $0.00
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Fisher Scientific Interboro Pkg. Corp. School Nurse Supply Kentron Health Care, Inc.
Pittsburgh, PA Montgomery, NY Schaumberg, IL Springfield, TN
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72 48 |6"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
73 | 330 [3"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
74 20 |6"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
75 55 |3"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
76 | 250 [Muslin Triangle Bandage $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.00 $1,750.00 $0.00 $0.00
77 70 |Surgical Tape $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
78 | 90 |12"x30" Trauma Dressing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
79 |1200|Headbed Il Head Immobilizer $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
80 | 1150 |Ambu-Perfit Adult Cervical Collar $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
81 | 190 |Ambu Perfit Pediatric Cervical Collar $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
82 | 30 |Disp. Limb Restraints $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
83 30 [P2 Safety Plus Exam glove Medium $8.95 $268.50 $2.10 $63.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
84 | 180 |P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Large $8.95 $1,611.00 $2.10 $378.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
85 | 970 |P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Extra Large $8.95 $8,681.50 $2.10 $2,037.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
86 | 40 |Firstline Blue Exam glove 2-XL $8.95 $358.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
87 | 16 |lsolation Disposable Gown Size:XXLG $2.06 $32.96 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
88 | 70 |Key Personal Protection Isolation Mask No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
89 | 10 |Disp. Isolation Cap hair Cover $21.61 $216.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
90 | 40 |Disp. 18" Protective Sleeve $33.79 $1,351.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
91 | 40 |Disposable Probe covers $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
92 4 |Disposable OB kit $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
93 | 40 |Emesis/Hazardous Waste Bag w/Hook $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
94 | 180 |Lifescan One touch Ultra Test Strip $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.00 $3,240.00
95 6 |Lifescan One touch Ultra Control Solution $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
96 | 30 |Unistik 2 Blood Sampling Device $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
97 | 240 |Instant Cold compress $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
98 | 120 |Disp. Prep Razor $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
99 4 [Nail Polish Remover Pads $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.12 $20.48 $0.00 $0.00
100 | 700 |EKG Electrode Con-Med#1700-030 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
101 | 240 |EKG paper Medtronics #11240-000016 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
102 | 140 |Quick Combo Adult #11996-00091 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
103 | 20 |Quick Combo Pediatric #11996-000093 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
104 | 110 [Masimo #1860 Disp. Pediatric Adhesive Sensor $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
105 | 30 [Phillips M1920A Adult/Pedi Filterline Set $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL BID $12,519.66 $2,478.00 $8,040.28 $9,759.40
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Accessibility Med. Supply

Moore Medical

Midwest Medical Supply

QuadMed, Inc.

Houston, TX Farmington, CT Earth City, MO Jacksonville, FL
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 10 Hudson RCI#1171 Airway 5.5 $1.64 $16.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.93 $9.30 $0.94 $9.40
2 10 Hudson RCI #1170 Airway $6 $1.64 $16.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.93 $9.30 $0.94 $9.40
3 10 Hudson RCI#1169 Airway #7 $1.64 $16.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.93 $9.30 $0.94 $9.40
4 40 Hudson #1168 Airway $8 $1.64 $65.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.93 $37.20 $0.94 $37.60
5 70 Hudson RCI#1167 Airway #10 $1.64 $114.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.93 $65.10 $0.94 $65.80
7 30 Hudson RCI#1166 Airway #11 $1.64 $49.20 $0.92 $27.60 $0.93 $27.90 $0.94 $28.20
8 10 Hudson RCI#1165 Airway #12 $1.64 $16.40 $0.92 $9.20 $0.93 $9.30 $0.94 $9.40
9 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-26 Nazo Airway 26FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.40 $28.80 $2.35 $28.20
10 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-30 Nazo Airway 30Fr $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.40 $28.80 $2.35 $28.20
11 450 Hospilak #302 -E Oxygen Cannula Adult $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.26 $117.00 $0.58 $261.00
12 150 B&F #64092 Pedi Oxygen Mask $0.96 $144.00 $0.73 $109.50 $0.52 $78.00 $1.68 $252.00
13 3700 Hudson RCI#1060 Nonrebreather Mask Adult $0.00 $0.00 $0.99 $3,663.00 $0.70 $2,590.00 $1.22 $4,514.00
14 250 Airlife Misty Max 10 #002438 Nebulizer $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.96 $240.00 $1.84 $460.00
15 6 Rusch #150025 Endo Tube 2.5mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.90 $23.40 $3.70 $22.20
16 6 Rusch #150030 Endo Tube 3.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.90 $23.40 $3.70 $22.20
17 6 Rusch #150040 Endo Tube 4.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.90 $23.40 $3.70 $22.20
18 8 Rusch #170050 Endo Tube 5.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.36 $34.88 $4.09 $32.72
19 80 Rusch #170060 Endo Tube 6.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.36 $348.80 $4.09 $327.20
20 60 Rusch #170070 Endo Tube 7.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.36 $261.60 $4.09 $245.40
21 30 Rusch #170080 Endo Tube 8.0mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.36 $130.80 $4.09 $122.70
22 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #0 Miller #4020 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $42.10 $4.26 $42.60 $4.09 $40.90
23 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #1 Miller #4021 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $42.10 $4.26 $42.60 $4.09 $40.90
24 20 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Miller #4022 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $84.20 $4.26 $85.20 $4.09 $81.80
25 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Mac #4042 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $42.10 $4.26 $42.60 $4.09 $40.90
26 25 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #3 Miller #4023 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $105.25 $4.26 $106.50 $4.09 $102.25
27 20 Rusch Larn. Blade #3 for Mac #4043 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $84.20 $4.26 $85.20 $4.09 $81.80
28 30 Rusch Laryn. Blade #4 for Mac #4044 $0.00 $0.00 $4.21 $126.30 $4.26 $127.80 $4.09 $122.70
29 10 King KLTSD413 Yellow Size 3 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00 $59.00 $590.00 $35.96 $359.60 $34.95 $349.50
30 25 King KLTSD414 Red Size 4 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00 $59.00 $1,475.00 $35.96 $899.00 $34.95 $873.75
31 15 King KLTSD415 Purple Size 5 Airway Tube 0 0 $59.00 $885.00 $35.96 $539.40 34.95 524.25
32 160 Ambu Spur Il Adult Disp. Resuscitator 0 0 $0.00 $0.00 $9.94 $1,590.40 13.49 2158.4
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Accessibility Med. Supply

Moore Medical

Midwest Medical Supply

QuadMed, Inc.

Houston, TX Farmington, CT Earth City, MO Jacksonville, FL
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
33 15 Ambu Spur Il Pediatric Disp. Resuscitator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.72 $160.80 $14.49 $217.35
34 4 Ambu Spur Il Infant Disp. Resusciator $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.68 $42.72 $14.49 $57.96
35 100 3M #1870 Flat Fold Disp. Respirator $0.00 $0.00 $21.00 $2,100.00 $0.84 $84.00 $1.1975 $119.75
36 75 Endo Tube Holder Ambu#320264040 $0.00 $0.00 $2.94 $220.50 $3.11 $233.25 $3.10 $232.50
37 30 Endo Tube Introducer 15FR/CH $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.80 $114.00 $3.89 $116.70
38 10 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #30820 Suction Catheter Sz 8 H $0.68 $6.80 $0.57 $5.70 $0.45 $4.50 $0.47 $4.70
39 20 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #31820 Suction Catheter Sz 18§ $0.00 $0.00 $0.57 $11.40 $0.45 $9.00 $0.47 $9.40
40 5 Kendall Safe-T-Vac Suction Catheter Size 5FR $0.00 $0.00 $0.68 $3.40 $0.45 $2.25 $0.47 $2.35
41 10 #142 Disposable Suction Bulb Sysring $0.00 $0.00 $0.84 $8.40 $0.88 $8.80 $1.09 $10.90
42 150 Medline DYND50246 Connecting Tubing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.80 $120.00 $0.81 $121.50
43 150 |HI-D Big Stick Pharyn. Suction Tip $0.00 $0.00 $1.51 $226.50 $1.99 $298.50 $1.82 $273.00
44 90 Bemiss System Il Disp. Suction Canister Red Top $0.00 $0.00 $2.22 $199.80 $2.02 $181.80 $2.10 $189.00
45 75 #42500-02 Introcan Cathlon 24gx3/4" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84 $138.00 $1.65 $123.75 $1.59 $119.25
46 450  |#4252519-02 Introcan Cathlon 22gx1" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84 $828.00 $1.65 $742.50 $1.59 $715.50
47 2800 |#4252535-02 Introcan Cathlon 20gx1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84] $5,152.00 $1.65| $4,620.00 $1.59] $4,452.00
48 860  [#4252560-02 Introcan Cathlong 18g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84| $1,582.40 $1.65[ $1,419.00 $1.59| $1,367.40
49 120  |#4252586-02 Introcan Cathlon 16g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84 $220.80 $1.65 $198.00 $1.59 $190.80
50 100  |#4251890-02 Introcan Cathlon 14g x 1 1/4" $0.00 $0.00 $1.84 $184.00 $1.65 $165.00 $1.59 $159.00
51 300 |#NN1838R Hyp. Needles 18g x 1 1/2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.056 $16.92] $0.0265 $7.95 $0.0386 $11.58
52 100  |#NN2325R Hyp. Needle 23g x 1 1/2" $0.00 $0.00 $0.056 $5.64| $0.0404 $4.04 $0.0386 $3.86
53 100 |[#NN2516R Hyp. Needle 25g x 5/8" $0.00 $0.00 $0.056 $5.64] $0.0265 $2.65 $0.0392 $3.92
54 15 Vidacare EZ-10 Needle Set 15 ga - 15mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55 35 Vidacare EZ-I0O Needle Set 15ga - 25mm $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
56 5 Vidacare #9077 EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
57 25 Terumo SS-30L Syring w/o Needle 30cc $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.35 $8.75 $0.39 $9.75
58 300 |Terumo SS10L Syring w/o Needle 10cc/ml $0.00 $0.00] $0.1340 $40.20 $0.088 $26.40 $0.1099 $32.97
59 100 Terumo SS-03L Syring w/o Needle 3cc/ml $0.00 $0.00 $0.07 $7.00f $0.0465 $4.65 $0.0639 $6.39
60 3000 |Selec-3 #B10-102 IV Admin Set $0.00 $0.00 $4.92| $14,760.00 $5.66| $16,980.00 $6.23| $18,690.00
61 3080 |Pro-Line #12125 IV Fild Start Kit $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
62 25 Alcohol Prep Pads $2.90 $72.50 $1.98 $49.50 $1.36 $34.00 $1.31 $32.75
63 10 Hydrogen Peroxide $0.00 $0.00 $0.94 $9.40 $0.65 $6.50 $0.82 $8.20
64 10 Personal Protection $0.00 $0.00 $17.85 $178.50 $16.50 $165.00 $16.45 $164.50
65 30 5x9 Surgical Dressing $0.00 $0.00 $2.77 $83.10 $2.17 $65.10 $2.13 $63.90
66 45 4"x4" Dressing Sponge $0.00 $0.00 $1.68 $75.60 $1.28 $57.60 $1.18 $53.10
67 30 3"x9" Adaptic Dressing $0.00 $0.00 $9.85 $295.50 $1.13 $33.90 $0.5966 $17.90
68 310 [Saline-WetDressing 8"x4" 12 Ply $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.32 $409.20 $5.59| $1,732.90
69 6 41"x38" Drape Sheet $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
70 4 2"x4" X-Lg. Bandaids $4.89 $19.56 $2.78 $11.12 $2.57 $10.28 $2.30 $9.20
71 25 1"x3" Reg. Bandaids $2.28 $57.00 $1.96 $49.00 $1.20 $30.00 $1.25 $31.25
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Accessibility Med. Supply

Moore Medical

Midwest Medical Supply

QuadMed, Inc.

Houston, TX Farmington, CT Earth City, MO Jacksonville, FL

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
72 48 6"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.00 $0.45 $21.60 $0.2516 $12.08 $0.23 $11.04
73 330 3"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.00 $0.1566 $51.68 $0.10 $33.00 $0.11 $36.30
74 20 6"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.98 $19.60 $11.48 $229.60 $0.75 $15.00 $0.74 $14.80
75 55 3"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.50 $27.50 $0.686 $37.73 $0.36 $19.80 $0.37 $20.35
76 250 Muslin Triangle Bandage $0.00 $0.32 $80.00 $0.24 $60.00 $0.24 $60.00
77 70 Surgical Tape $0.00 $13.84 $968.80 $1.48 $103.60 $1.3625 $95.38
78 90 12"x30" Trauma Dressing $0.00 $0.98 $88.20 $1.15 $103.50 $0.94 $84.60
79 1200 |Headbed Il Head Immobilizer $0.00 $4.16] $4,992.00 $4.45| $5,340.00 $5.45 $6,540.00
80 1150 |Ambu-Perfit Adult Cervical Collar $0.00 $5.25| $6,037.50 $5.09| $5,853.50 $5.63 $6,474.50
81 190 |Ambu Perfit Pediatric Cervical Collar $0.00 $5.25 $997.50 $5.09 $967.10 $6.80| $1,292.00
82 30 Disp. Limb Restraints $0.00 $3.34 $100.20 $3.13 $93.90 $2.73 $81.90
83 30 P2 Safety Plus Exam glove Medium $0.00 $13.52 $405.60 $6.92 $207.60 $0.00 $0.00
84 180 |P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Large $0.00 $13.52| $2,433.60 $6.92 $1,245.60 $0.00 $0.00
85 970 P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Extra Large $0.00 $13.52] $13,114.40 $6.92| $6,712.40 $0.00 $0.00
86 40 Firstline Blue Exam glove 2-XL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.15 $246.00 $0.00 $0.00
87 16 Isolation Disposable Gown Size:XXLG $0.00 $4.60 $73.60 $7.49 $119.84 $0.56 $8.96
88 70 Key Personal Protection Isolation Mask $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
89 10 Disp. Isolation Cap hair Cover $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $0.0458 $0.46 $0.07 $0.70
90 40 Disp. 18" Protective Sleeve $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.48 $19.20 $0.2017 $8.07
91 40 Disposable Probe covers $0.00 $10.40 $416.00 $1.04 $41.60 $11.36 $454.40
92 4 Disposable OB kit $0.00 $5.56 $22.24 $5.00 $20.00 $4.65 $18.60
93 40 Emesis/Hazardous Waste Bag w/Hook $0.00 $1.38 $55.20 $1.50 $60.00 $1.37 $54.80
94 180 Lifescan One touch Ultra Test Strip $0.00 $54.17( $9,750.60 $28.16f $5,068.80 $29.53 $5,315.40
95 6 Lifescan One touch Ultra Control Solution $0.00 $8.95 $53.70 $4.20 $25.20 $10.05 $60.30
96 30 Unistik 2 Blood Sampling Device $0.00 $15.35 $460.50 $15.59 $467.70 $17.05 $511.50
97 240 [Instant Cold compress $0.00 $0.457 $109.68 $0.38 $91.20 $0.42 $100.80
98 120 Disp. Prep Razor $0.44 $52.80 $0.386 $46.32 $0.35 $42.00 $0.1791 $21.49
99 4 Nail Polish Remover Pads $4.32 $17.28 $3.00 $12.00 $2.29 $9.16 $3.08 $12.32
100 700 EKG Electrode Con-Med#1700-030 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.31 $3,017.00 $3.88 $2,716.00
101 240 EKG paper Medtronics #11240-000016 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.62| $2,068.80 $10.63 $2,551.20
102 140 Quick Combo Adult #11996-00091 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.32| $2,564.80 $23.64f $3,309.60
103 20 Quick Combo Pediatric #11996-000093 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.32 $366.40 $24.45 $489.00
104 110 |Masimo #1860 Disp. Pediatric Adhesive Senso $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $13.92] $1,531.20 $15.45] $1,699.50
105 30 Phillips M1920A Adult/Pedi Filterline Set $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.78 $233.40
TOTAL BID $712.24 $74,311.82 $70,917.50 $72,432.50
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Bound Tree Medical

Cardinal Health

Henry Schein-Matrix

AAA Wholesale Co., Inc.

Dublin, OH Houston, TX Irmo, SC San Francisco, CA
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 10 Hudson RCI#1171 Airway 5.5 $0.94 $9.40 0.936 $9.36 $0.81 $8.10 $0.91 $9.10
2 10 Hudson RCI #1170 Airway $6 $0.94 $9.40 0.936 $9.36 $0.79 $7.90 $0.91 $9.10
3 10 Hudson RCI#1169 Airway #7 $0.94 $9.40 0.936 $9.36 $0.72 $7.20 $0.91 $9.10
4 40 Hudson #1168 Airway $8 $0.94 $37.60 0.936 $37.44 $0.82 $32.80 $0.91 $36.40
5 70 Hudson RCI#1167 Airway #10 $0.94 $65.80 0.936 $65.52 $0.79 $55.30 $0.91 $63.70
7 30 Hudson RCI#1166 Airway #11 $0.94 $28.20 0.936 $28.08 $0.80 $24.00 $0.91 $27.30
8 10 Hudson RCI#1165 Airway #12 $0.94 $9.40 0.936 $9.36 $0.82 $8.20 $0.91 $9.10
9 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-26 Nazo Airway 26FR $1.83 $21.96 3.255 $39.06 $1.71 $20.52 $0.91 $10.92
10 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-30 Nazo Airway 30Fr $1.83 $21.96 3.255 $39.06 $1.71 $20.52 $2.42 $29.04
11 450 Hospilak #302 -E Oxygen Cannula Adult $0.41 $184.50 0.391 $175.95 $0.35 $157.50 $0.45 $202.50
12 150 B&F #64092 Pedi Oxygen Mask $1.24 $186.00 1.784 $267.60 $0.68 $102.00 $1.00 $150.00
13 3700 Hudson RCI#1060 Nonrebreather Mask Adult $0.95 $3,515.00 1.854 $6,859.80 $1.69 $6,253.00 $0.21 $777.00
14 250 Airlife Misty Max 10 #002438 Nebulizer $0.83 $207.50 0.630 $157.50 $0.74 $185.00 $0.97 $242.50
15 6 Rusch #150025 Endo Tube 2.5mm $3.76 $22.56 0.000 $0.00 $2.99 $17.94 $4.11 $24.66
16 6 Rusch #150030 Endo Tube 3.0mm $3.76 $22.56 0.000 $0.00 $3.18 $19.08 $4.39 $26.34
17 6 Rusch #150040 Endo Tube 4.0mm $3.76 $22.56 4.465 $26.79 $2.91 $17.46 $4.11 $24.66
18 8 Rusch #170050 Endo Tube 5.0mm $4.25 $34.00 0.000 $0.00 $2.85 $22.80 $4.96 $39.68
19 80 Rusch #170060 Endo Tube 6.0mm $4.25 $340.00 0.000 $0.00 $3.04 $243.20 $4.65 $372.00
20 60 Rusch #170070 Endo Tube 7.0mm $4.25 $255.00 5.053 $303.18 $3.42 $205.20 $4.65 $279.00
21 30 Rusch #170080 Endo Tube 8.0mm $4.25 $127.50 0.000 $0.00 $3.50 $105.00 $4.96 $148.80
22 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #0 Miller #4020 $4.22 $42.20 5.454 $54.54 $4.10 $41.00 $5.01 $50.10
23 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #1 Miller #4021 $4.22 $42.20 5.454 $54.54 $4.73 $47.30 $5.01 $50.10
24 20 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Miller #4022 $4.22 $84.40 5.454 $109.08 $4.72 $94.40 $5.01 $100.20
25 10 Rusch Laryn Blade for #2 Mac #4042 $4.22 $42.20 5.454 $54.54 $3.91 $39.10 $5.01 $50.10
26 25 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #3 Miller #4023 $4.22 $105.50 5.454 $136.35 $4.73 $118.25 $5.01 $125.25
27 20 Rusch Larn. Blade #3 for Mac #4043 $4.22 $84.40 5.454 $109.08 $4.09 $81.80 $5.01 $100.20
28 30 Rusch Laryn. Blade #4 for Mac #4044 $4.22 $126.60 5.454 $163.62 $4.01 $120.30 $5.01 $150.30
29 10 King KLTSD413 Yellow Size 3 Airway Tube $33.98 $339.80 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34.90 $1,430.90
30 25 King KLTSD414 Red Size 4 Airway Tube $33.98 $849.50 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34.90 $872.50
31 15 King KLTSD415 Purple Size 5 Airway Tube $33.98 $509.70 0.000 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $34.90 $523.50
32 160 Ambu Spur Il Adult Disp. Resuscitator $8.67 $1,387.20 126.450 20,232.000 $13.37 $2,139.20 $8.85 $1,416.00

Page 7 of 12




Bound Tree Medical

Cardinal Health

Henry Schein-Matrix

AAA Wholesale Co., Inc.

Dublin, OH Houston, TX Irmo, SC San Francisco, CA
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE |TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
33 15 Ambu Spur Il Pediatric Disp. Resuscitator 9.58 $143.70 303.050 $4,545.75 $11.92 $178.80 $12.03 $180.45
34 4 Ambu Spur Il Infant Disp. Resusciator 9.58 $38.32 0.000 $0.00 $11.92 $47.68 $13.16 $52.64
35 100 3M #1870 Flat Fold Disp. Respirator $1.0670 $106.70 1.061 $106.10 $0.83 $83.00 $0.70 $70.00
36 75 Endo Tube Holder Ambu#320264040 2.93 $219.75 4.257 $319.28 $2.88 $216.00 $3.11 $233.25
37 30 Endo Tube Introducer 15FR/CH 5.12 $153.60 5.591 $167.73 $4.80 $144.00 $5.37 $161.10
38 10 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #30820 Suction Catheter Sz 8 F 0.46 $4.60 0.558 $5.58 $0.42 $4.20 $1.13 $11.30
39 20 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #31820 Suction Catheter Sz 18H 0.39 $7.80 0.477 $9.54 $0.36 $7.20 $0.38 $7.60
40 5 Kendall Safe-T-Vac Suction Catheter Size 5FR $16.422 $82.11 0.626 $3.13 $0.46 $2.30 $0.45 $2.25
41 10 #142 Disposable Suction Bulb Sysring 0.72 $7.20 0.933 $9.33 $0.70 $7.00 $0.89 $8.90
42 150 Medline DYND50246 Connecting Tubing 0.76 $114.00 1.213 $181.95 $0.62 $93.00 $0.64 $96.00
43 150 HI-D Big Stick Pharyn. Suction Tip 1.6 $240.00 0.000 $0.00 $1.92 $288.00 $1.64 $246.00
44 90 Bemiss System Il Disp. Suction Canister Red Top 2.41 $216.90 2.400 $216.00 $1.93 $173.70 $2.19 $197.10
45 75 #42500-02 Introcan Cathlon 24gx3/4" 1.45 $108.75 2.118 $158.85 $1.64 $123.00 $4.21 $315.75
46 450 #4252519-02 Introcan Cathlon 22gx1" 1.45 $652.50 2.118 $953.10 $1.60 $720.00 $2.13 $958.50
47 2800 [#4252535-02 Introcan Cathlon 20gx1 1/4" 1.45 $4,060.00 2.118 $5,930.40 $1.65 $4,620.00 $2.13 $5,964.00
48 860 #4252560-02 Introcan Cathlong 18g x 1 1/4" 1.45 $1,247.00 2.118 $1,821.48 $1.66 $1,427.60 $2.13 $1,831.80
49 120 #4252586-02 Introcan Cathlon 16g x 1 1/4" 1.45 $174.00 2.118 $254.16 $1.65 $198.00 $2.13 $255.60
50 100 #4251890-02 Introcan Cathlon 14g x 1 1/4" 1.45 $145.00 2.311 $231.10 $1.65 $165.00 $2.10 $210.00
51 300 #NN1838R Hyp. Needles 18g x 1 1/2" $0.046 $13.71 0.041 $12.30 $0.05 $15.00 $0.03 $9.00
52 100 #NN2325R Hyp. Needle 23g x 1 1/2" $0.0445 $4.45 0.041 $4.10 $0.05 $5.00 $0.03 $3.00
53 100 #NN2516R Hyp. Needle 259 x 5/8" $0.0445 $4.45 0.041 $4.10 $0.05 $5.00 $0.04 $4.00
54 15 Vidacare EZ-10 Needle Set 15 ga - 16mm 132 $1,980.00 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $107.00 $1,605.00
55 35 Vidacare EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga - 25mm 132 $4,620.00 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $107.00 $3,745.00
56 5 Vidacare #9077 EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga. 153.33 $766.65 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $127.00 $635.00
57 25 Terumo SS-30L Syring w/o Needle 30cc 0.42 $10.50 0.384 $9.60 $0.32 $8.00 $0.28 $7.00
58 300 Terumo SS10L Syring w/o Needle 10cc/ml 0.13 $39.00 0.117 $35.10 $0.10 $30.00 $0.10 $30.00
59 100 Terumo SS-03L Syring w/o Needle 3cc/ml 0.07 $7.00 0.065 $6.50 $0.07 $7.00 $0.05 $5.00
60 3000 |Selec-3 #B10-102 IV Admin Set 4.98 $14,940.00 0.000 $0.00 $4.50 $13,500.00 $5.06 $15,180.00
61 3080 |Pro-Line #12125 IV Fild Start Kit 5.94 $18,295.20 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.50 $7,700.00
62 25 Alcohol Prep Pads 1.28 $32.00 1.320 $33.00 $1.17 $29.25 $1.17 $29.25
63 10 Hydrogen Peroxide 1.13 $11.30 0.740 $7.40 $0.55 $5.50 $0.62 $6.20
64 10 Personal Protection 15.51 $155.10 0.829 $8.29 $17.28 $172.80 $18.84 $188.40
65 30 5x9 Surgical Dressing 2.89 $86.70 25.590 $767.70 $2.62 $78.60 $4.30 $129.00
66 45 4"x4" Dressing Sponge $1.0975 $49.39 3.220 $144.90 $1.16 $52.20 $15.36 $691.20
67 30 3"x9" Adaptic Dressing $1.3654 $40.96 1.158 $34.74 $0.40 $12.00 $1.84 $55.20
68 310 Saline-WetDressing 8"x4" 12 Ply 1.35 $418.50 1.735 $537.85 $0.62 $192.20 $1.32 $409.20
69 6 41"x38" Drape Sheet 0.51 $3.06 0.942 $5.65 $0.12 $0.72 $23.88 $143.28
70 4 2"x4" X-Lg. Bandaids 3.93 $15.72 5.780 $23.12 $2.36 $9.44 $3.09 $12.36
71 25 1"x3" Reg. Bandaids 2.33 $58.25 4.190 $104.75 $0.98 $24.50 $2.07 $51.75
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Bound Tree Medical

Cardinal Health

Henry Schein-Matrix

AAA Wholesale Co., Inc.

Dublin, OH Houston, TX Irmo, SC San Francisco, CA

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE [TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
72 48 6"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.2550 $12.24 2.670 $128.16 $0.30 $14.40 $0.31 $14.88
73 330 3"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.1116 $36.83 1.330 $438.90 $0.09 $29.70 $0.12 $39.60
74 20 6"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.70 $14.00 0.653 $13.06 $0.56 $11.20 $0.96 $19.20
75 55 3"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.30 $16.50 0.363 $19.97 $0.34 $18.70 $0.57 $31.08
76 250 Muslin Triangle Bandage $0.17 $42.50 1.550 $387.50 $0.22 $55.00 $2.97 $742.50
77 70 Surgical Tape $3.4950 $244.65 3.515 $246.05 $2.27 $158.90 $1.70 $119.00
78 90 12"x30" Trauma Dressing $1.24 $111.60 1.629 $146.61 $0.92 $82.80 $0.89 $80.10
79 1200 [Headbed Il Head Immobilizer $4.13 $4,956.00 0.000 $0.00 $4.60 $5,520.00 $4.13 $4,956.00
80 1150 [Ambu-Perfit Adult Cervical Collar $4.21 $4,841.50 10.366 $11,920.90 $4.88 $5,612.00 $9.75 $11,212.50
81 190 Ambu Perfit Pediatric Cervical Collar $4.21 $799.90 10.366 $1,969.54 $4.75 $902.50 $10.75 $2,042.50
82 30 Disp. Limb Restraints $3.28 $98.40 4.089 $122.67 $3.58 $107.40 $5.27 $158.10
83 30 P2 Safety Plus Exam glove Medium $13.29 $398.70 16.860 $505.80 $36.13 $1,083.90 $12.80 $384.00
84 180 P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Large $13.29 $2,392.20 16.860 $3,034.80 $36.13 $6,503.40 $12.80 $2,304.00
85 970 P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Extra Large $13.29 $12,891.30 16.860 $16,354.20 $36.13 $35,046.10 $12.80 $12,416.00
86 40 Firstline Blue Exam glove 2-XL $7.72 $308.80 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.00 $280.00
87 16 Isolation Disposable Gown Size:XXLG $1.92 $30.72 2.260 $36.16 $0.00 $0.00 $44.00 $704.00
88 70 Key Personal Protection Isolation Mask $3.81 $266.70 0.000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.00 $630.00
89 10 Disp. Isolation Cap hair Cover $0.06 $0.60 0.063 $0.63 $0.16 $1.60 $29.00 $290.00
90 40 Disp. 18" Protective Sleeve $0.10 $4.00 0.336 $13.44 $0.11 $4.40 $9.35 $374.00
91 40 Disposable Probe covers $0.911 $36.44 1.113 $44.52 $0.77 $30.80 $10.18 $407.20
92 4 Disposable OB kit $5.83 $23.32 0.000 $0.00 $4.60 $18.40 $9.74 $38.96
93 40 Emesis/Hazardous Waste Bag w/Hook $1.4058 $56.23 0.000 $0.00 $1.38 $55.20 $1.57 $62.80
94 180 Lifescan One touch Ultra Test Strip $28.505 $5,130.90 28.330 $5,099.40 $26.74 $4,813.20 $28.65 $5,157.00
95 6 Lifescan One touch Ultra Control Solution $8.41 $50.46 9.000 $54.00 $7.60 $45.60 $8.15 $48.90
96 30 Unistik 2 Blood Sampling Device $16.46 $493.80 15.760 $472.80 $13.48 $404.40 $15.36 $460.80
97 240 Instant Cold compress $0.25166 $60.40 0.000 $0.00 $0.27 $64.80 $0.37 $88.80
98 120 Disp. Prep Razor $0.34 $40.80 0.388 $46.56 $0.32 $38.40 $2.05 $246.00
99 4 Nail Polish Remover Pads $3.21 $12.84 2.690 $10.76 $2.91 $11.64 $2.93 $11.72
100 700 EKG Electrode Con-Med#1700-030 $4.57 $3,199.00 8.320 $5,824.00 $7.62 $5,334.00 $8.35 $5,845.00
101 240 EKG paper Medtronics #11240-000016 $1.702 $408.48 8.160 $1,958.40 $7.46 $1,790.40 $8.05 $1,932.00
102 140 Quick Combo Adult #11996-00091 $25.37 $3,551.80 35.700 $4,998.00 $32.65 $4,571.00 $34.99 $4,898.60
103 20 Quick Combo Pediatric #11996-000093 $27.32 $546.40 36.040 $720.80 $31.27 $625.40 $34.99 $699.80
104 110 Masimo #1860 Disp. Pediatric Adhesive Sensor $16.59 $1,824.90 14.970 $1,646.70 $15.01 $1,651.10 $17.75 $1,952.50
105 30 Phillips M1920A Adult/Pedi Filterline Set $7.32 $219.60 12.168 $365.04 $7.42 $222.60 $271.00 $8,130.00
TOTAL BID $101,140.38 $102,183.11 $107,668.70 $115,578.67
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Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
1 10 Hudson RCI#1171 Airway 5.5 $0.79 $7.90
2 10 Hudson RCI #1170 Airway $6 $0.79 $7.90
3 10 Hudson RCI#1169 Airway #7 $0.79 $7.90
4 40 Hudson #1168 Airway $8 $0.79 $31.60
5 70 Hudson RCI#1167 Airway #10 $0.79 $55.30
7 30 Hudson RCI#1166 Airway #11 $0.79 $23.70
8 10 Hudson RCI#1165 Airway #12 $0.79 $7.90
9 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-26 Nazo Airway 26FR $2.65 $31.80
10 12 Robertazzi #1-5076-30 Nazo Airway 30Fr $2.65 $31.80
11 450 Hospilak #302 -E Oxygen Cannula Adult $3.45 $1,552.50
12 150 B&F #64092 Pedi Oxygen Mask $1.10 $165.00
13 3700 Hudson RCI#1060 Nonrebreather Mask Adult $0.80 $2,960.00
14 250 Airlife Misty Max 10 #002438 Nebulizer $0.75 $187.50
15 6 Rusch #150025 Endo Tube 2.5mm $4.95 $29.70
16 6 Rusch #150030 Endo Tube 3.0mm $4.95 $29.70
17 6 Rusch #150040 Endo Tube 4.0mm $4.95 $29.70
18 8 Rusch #170050 Endo Tube 5.0mm $4.95 $39.60
19 80 Rusch #170060 Endo Tube 6.0mm $4.95 $396.00
20 60 Rusch #170070 Endo Tube 7.0mm $4.95 $297.00
21 30 Rusch #170080 Endo Tube 8.0mm $4.95 $148.50
22 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #0 Miller #4020 $4.30 $43.00
23 10 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #1 Miller #4021 $4.30 $43.00
24 20 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #2 Miller #4022 $4.30 $86.00
25 10 Rusch Laryn Blade for #2 Mac #4042 $4.30 $43.00
26 25 Rusch Laryn. Blade for #3 Miller #4023 $4.30 $107.50
27 20 Rusch Larn. Blade #3 for Mac #4043 $4.30 $86.00
28 30 Rusch Laryn. Blade #4 for Mac #4044 $4.30 $129.00
29 10 King KLTSD413 Yellow Size 3 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00
30 25 King KLTSD414 Red Size 4 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00
31 15 King KLTSD415 Purple Size 5 Airway Tube $0.00 $0.00
32 160 Ambu Spur Il Adult Disp. Resuscitator $10.50 $1,680.00

Page 10 of 12




Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
33 15 Ambu Spur Il Pediatric Disp. Resuscitator $13.40 $201.00
34 4 Ambu Spur Il Infant Disp. Resusciator $13.60 $54.40
35 100 3M #1870 Flat Fold Disp. Respirator $1.50 $150.00
36 75 Endo Tube Holder Ambu#320264040 $3.90 $292.50
37 30 Endo Tube Introducer 15FR/CH $5.90 $177.00
38 10 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #30820 Suction Catheter Sz 8 FR $0.78 $7.80
39 20 Kendall Safe-T-Vac #31820 Suction Catheter Sz 18FR $0.78 $15.60
40 5 Kendall Safe-T-Vac Suction Catheter Size 5FR $0.78 $3.90
41 10 #142 Disposable Suction Bulb Sysring $1.20 $12.00
42 150 Medline DYND50246 Connecting Tubing $0.65 $97.50
43 150 HI-D Big Stick Pharyn. Suction Tip $2.50 $375.00
44 90 Bemiss System Il Disp. Suction Canister Red Top $2.50 $225.00
45 75 #42500-02 Introcan Cathlon 24gx3/4" $1.80 $135.00
46 450 #4252519-02 Introcan Cathlon 22gx1" $1.80 $810.00
47 2800 |#4252535-02 Introcan Cathlon 20gx1 1/4" $1.80 $5,040.00
48 860 #4252560-02 Introcan Cathlong 18g x 1 1/4" $1.80 $1,548.00
49 120 #4252586-02 Introcan Cathlon 16g x 1 1/4" $1.80 $216.00
50 100 #4251890-02 Introcan Cathlon 14g x 1 1/4" $1.80 $180.00
51 300 #NN1838R Hyp. Needles 18g x 1 1/2" $0.07 $21.00
52 100 #NN2325R Hyp. Needle 23g x 1 1/2" $0.07 $7.00
53 100 #NN2516R Hyp. Needle 259 x 5/8" $0.07 $7.00
54 15 Vidacare EZ-10 Needle Set 15 ga - 15mm $0.00 $0.00
55 35 Vidacare EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga - 25mm $0.00 $0.00
56 5 Vidacare #9077 EZ-10 Needle Set 15ga. $0.00 $0.00
57 25 Terumo SS-30L Syring w/o Needle 30cc $1.00 $25.00
58 300 Terumo SS10L Syring w/o Needle 10cc/ml $0.12 $36.00
59 100 Terumo SS-03L Syring w/o Needle 3cc/ml $0.08 $8.00
60 3000 |Selec-3 #B10-102 IV Admin Set $6.80 $20,400.00
61 3080 |Pro-Line #12125 IV Fild Start Kit $0.00 $0.00
62 25 Alcohol Prep Pads $1.50 $37.50
63 10 Hydrogen Peroxide $0.90 $9.00
64 10 Personal Protection $0.00 $0.00
65 30 5x9 Surgical Dressing $2.10 $63.00
66 45 4"x4" Dressing Sponge $1.40 $63.00
67 30 3"x9" Adaptic Dressing $1.60 $48.00
68 310 Saline-WetDressing 8"x4" 12 Ply $2.20 $682.00
69 6 41"x38" Drape Sheet $0.00 $0.00
70 4 2"x4" X-Lg. Bandaids $2.90 $11.60
71 25 1"x3" Reg. Bandaids $1.35 $33.75
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Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY

ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL
72 48 6"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.27 $12.96
73 330 3"x5Yards Non-Sterile Kling $0.12 $39.60
74 20 6"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.72 $14.40
75 55 3"x62" Elastic Bandage $0.35 $19.25
76 250 Muslin Triangle Bandage $0.30 $75.00
77 70 Surgical Tape $4.90 $343.00
78 90 12"x30" Trauma Dressing $1.00 $90.00
79 1200 [Headbed Il Head Immobilizer $5.55 $6,660.00
80 1150 |[Ambu-Perfit Adult Cervical Collar $6.36 $7,314.00
81 190 |[Ambu Perfit Pediatric Cervical Collar $6.36 $1,208.40
82 30 Disp. Limb Restraints $3.95 $118.50
83 30 P2 Safety Plus Exam glove Medium $42.00 $1,260.00
84 180 P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Large $42.00 $7,560.00
85 970 P2 Safety Plus Exam Glove Extra Large $42.00 $40,740.00
86 40 Firstline Blue Exam glove 2-XL $0.00 $0.00
87 16 Isolation Disposable Gown Size:XXLG $0.00 $0.00
88 70 Key Personal Protection Isolation Mask $0.00 $0.00
89 10 Disp. Isolation Cap hair Cover $0.06 $0.60
90 40 Disp. 18" Protective Sleeve $0.00 $0.00
91 40 Disposable Probe covers $11.00 $440.00
92 4 Disposable OB kit $4.35 $17.40
93 40 Emesis/Hazardous Waste Bag w/Hook $1.00 $40.00
94 180 Lifescan One touch Ultra Test Strip $0.85 $153.00
95 6 Lifescan One touch Ultra Control Solution $4.80 $28.80
96 30 Unistik 2 Blood Sampling Device $21.00 $630.00
97 240 Instant Cold compress $0.50 $120.00
98 120 Disp. Prep Razor $0.07 $8.40
99 4 Nail Polish Remover Pads $5.00 $20.00
100 700 EKG Electrode Con-Med#1700-030 $8.80 $6,160.00
101 240 EKG paper Medtronics #11240-000016 $0.00 $0.00
102 140 Quick Combo Adult #11996-00091 $0.00 $0.00
103 20 Quick Combo Pediatric #11996-000093 $0.00 $0.00
104 110 Masimo #1860 Disp. Pediatric Adhesive Sensor $39.00 $4,290.00
105 30 Phillips M1920A Adult/Pedi Filterline Set $16.90 $507.00
TOTAL BID $117,121.36
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