CITY OF VICTORIA
BID TABULATION

FOR

YEAR MODEL 2009 VEHICLES

October 8, 2008

Mac Haik Ford
Victoria, Texas

Philpott Motors
Port Neches, TX

Planet Ford
Caldwell, Texas

Atzenhoffer
Victoria, Texas

ITEM|QT DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
1 13 |Year Model 2009 Four-Door
Sedans - Police Package No Bid No Bid $21,495.00 | $279,435.00| $21,987.00| $285,831.00|No Bid No Bid
2 6 |Year Model 2009 Full Size
Reg. Cab 1/2-Ton Pickup $15,575.40 $93,452.40| $15,066.00 | $90,396.00 | $13,944.00| $83,664.00( $17,945.88| $107,675.28
ADDITIVE BID E-85 COMPATIBLE VEHICLE
3 6 |Additonal Cost to Ensure that
the Vehicle is E-85 Compatible N/A N/A $1,266.00 $7,596.00 $1,220.00 $7,320.00 $500.00 $3,000.00
DEDUCTIVE/ALTERNATE TRADE-IN
4 1 |Year Model 1999 Ford 1/2 Ton
Pickup, Unit 804 -$1,500.00 -$800.00 -$500.00 -$1,850.00
5 1 |Year Model 1997 Chevrolet
1/2-Ton Pickup, Unit 892 -$1,500.00 -$300.00 -$500.00 -$1,500.00
6 1 |Year Model 1999 Ford 1/2 Ton
Pickup, Unit 420 -$500.00 -$700.00 -$500.00 -$500.00
7 1 |Year Model 2003 Chevrolet
1/2 Ton Pickup, Unit 640 -$2,500.00 -$1,500.00 -$1,500.00 -$1,000.00
8 1 |Year Model 1999 Ford 1/2-Ton
Pickup, Unit 623 -$1,500.00 -$800.00 -$750.00 -$1,500.00
9 1 |Year Model 1998 Chevrolet
1/2 Ton Pickup, Unit 309 -$1,500.00 -$600.00 -$750.00 -$1,500.00
10 1 |Year Model 2009 HD Reg. Cab
3/4 ton Pickup $19,264.12 $18,325.00 $17,347.00 $21,615.86
DEDUCTIVE/ALTERNATE TRADE-IN
11 1 [Year Model 1997 Chevrolet
1/2-Ton Pickup, Unit 611 -$1,500.00 -$400.00 -$500.00 -$1,000.00
12 1 |Year Model 2009 1 & 1/2 Ton
Creb Cab w/Service Body $36,965.67 $38,651.00 $34,685.00 $37,087.99
OPTION
13 1 |12 Volt Boom Elevation Crane $8,248.00 $4,914.00 $8,929.00 $8,323.00
DEDUCTIVE/ALTERNATE TRADE-IN
14 1 |Year Model 1999 International
Truck, Unit 615 No Bid -$2,000.00 -$1,000.00{No Bid No Bid
15 3 |Year Model 2009 4-Door SUV $17,016.27 $51,048.81| $18,129.00| $54,387.00 $18,773.00| $56,319.00( $16,463.90| $49,391.70
TOTAL BID $198,479.00 $486,604.00 $488,095.00 $218,243.83




